
Bid Tabulation
06Cm-56

Unit Price
Omniform, 
Inc. Formost JD Printing

We The 
People

#1 Checks
500/box 35 box 125.97$        61.80$                   108.53$         NO BID
1000/box 25 box 152.10$        72.15$                   143.96$         NO BID
1500/box 25 box 193.05$        100.55$                 160.96$         NO BID

#2 Envelopes
500/box 100 box 35.75$          35.07$                   22.00$           248.00$           

#3 Deposit Tickets
500/box 40 box 45.50$          43.64$                   63.68$           NO BID
1000/box 50 box 87.10$          68.07$                   89.92$           NO BID
1500/box 25 box 127.40$        95.05$                   120.64$         NO BID

#4 Receipts NO BID
500/box 30 box 122.85$        60.09$                   124.10$         NO BID
1000/box 40 box 139.10$        94.41$                   144.37$         NO BID
1500/box 25 box 173.55$        125.49$                 198.11$         NO BID

Total Price (1 Year) 39,560.95$   26,229.20$            38,130.85$    24,800.00$      

Total Price (2 Years 79,121.90$   52,458.40$           76,261.70$    49,600.00$      
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