05CM-118, Cookies

Opened 5/18/05

VENDOR: | LINDEN COOKIES | LANCE, INC.
Item | Description Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1 Fudge Chip (3/pack) est. 60,000 packs 0.21 12,600.00 No Bid
2 Butter Crunch (3/pack) est. 85,000 packs 0.21 17,850.00 No Bid
3 Raisin Oatmeal (3/pack) est. 8,000 packs 0.21 1,680.00 No Bid
4 Chocolate Chip (3/pack) est. 90,000 packs 0.21 18,900.00 No Bid
5 Chocolate Chip (2/pack) est. 60,000 packs 0.165 9,900.00 No Bid
6 Raisin Oatmeal (2/pack) est. 5,000 packs 0.165 825.00 No Bid
7 Butter Crunch (2/pack) est. 30,000 packs 0.165 4,950.00 No Bid
8 Fudge Chip (2/pack) est. 35,000 packs 0.165 5,775.00 No Bid
9 Iced Fudge Brownies (Ind.) est. 30,000 packs 0.235 7,050.00 0.31 9,300.00
Mello Crisp Marshmallow Treat (Ind.) est.
10 35,000 0.235 8,225.00 No Bid
GRAND TOTAL: 87,755.00 | Incomplete 9,300.00

Bold indicates awardee.




