06CM-42
Cardboard Boxes
Bid Tabulation

Company Standard Stationery Supply  |Willard Packaging Co. Pride Enterprises Stephen Gould

Item 1 NO BID 0.515 0.91 0.62
Item 2 NO BID 0.81 1.28 1.4
Item 3 NO BID 3.05 55 3.25
Item 4 NO BID 1.26 3.28 1.65
Item 5 NO BID 4.97 5.54 4.75
Item 6 1.01 0.99 NO BID 38.85
Item 7 2.1 6.5 NO BID 7.25
Total Price 307 26,033.00 NO BID 37,882.50
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