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Eric Armin, Inc.

Fisher 
Science 
Education

The Bach 
Company

HPI 
International, 
Inc.

TI CBL2 Calculator 
Based Laboratory 2  $                144.50 175.98$        154.00$           NO BID
MDBTB Motion 
Detector 66.00$                  78.54$          72.00$             NO BID

MCABTA Microphone 34.00$                  37.77$          36.75$             NO BID

BARBTA Barometer 53.00$                  66.86$          60.90$             NO BID

PHBTA PH SYSTEM 70.00$                  78.06$          77.50$             NO BID
RHBTA Relative 
Humidity Sensor 64.00$                  80.72$          70.50$             NO BID
SFSBTA Student 
Force Sensor 90.00$                  114.98$        114.50$           NO BID
ACCBTA 
Accelerometer 83.00$                  113.44$        103.95$           NO BID
LGABTA 
Accelerometer 89.00$                  103.99$        102.90$           NO BID
EKGBTA EKG 
Sensor 129.00$                158.79$        148.00$           NO BID

DFSBTA Dual 
Ranger Force Sensor 104.00$                116.53$        114.50$           NO BID
TPLBTA 
Temperature Probe 64.00$                  82.86$          73.50$             NO BID
DINBTA CBL DIN 
Adaptor 4.00$                    5.05$            5.00$               NO BID
TIAC9201 Adaptor 
Port 10.00$                  13.42$          4.50$               NO BID
TI 92 Plus Graphing 
Calculator -$                      207.25$        135.82$            
TI 83 Plus Graphing 
Calculator 86.38$                  115.62$        88.50$             94.22$              
TI 84 Plus Graphing 
Calculator 95.70$                  161.60$        97.50$             104.68$            
TI 84 Plus Graphing 
Calculator EZ Spot 
(school bus yellow) *       $957.00 1,345.32$     97.50$             NO BID
TI 84 Plus Silver 
Edition Graphing 
Calculator *         113.96 132.42$        116.80$           128.30$            
TI 84 Plus Silver 
Edition Graphing EZ 
Spot (school bus 
yellow) 1,139.60               1,324.22$     116.80$           NO BID
TI 73 CLAMSHELL 
Graphing Calculator 57.85$                  101.08$        59.40$             94.22$              
TI 89 Graphics 
Graphing Calculator -$                      232.30$        135.82$            
TI 89 Titanium 
Graphing Calculator 123.50$                232.30$        127.50$           135.82
TI 73VSII View 
Screen Set 265.00$                308.61$        277.99$           NO BID

TI-84 Plus Silver VSII 294.00$                164.12$        308.00$           NO BID
Presentation Link 
adapter for TI-84 
Plus Family 31.00$                  50.86$          33.00$             NO BID
Presentation Link 
adapter for TI-89 
Titanium 31.00$                  50.86$          43.30$             NO BID
TI-89 VSII View 
Screen Set 344.25$                372.49$        358.00$           NO BID
TI-92VSH View 
Screen Panel 207.20$                372.49$        219.00$           NO BID
TI Keyboard 33.10$                  49.06$          37.00$             NO BID
Colored Slide Cases 
for TI-73, TI-83 Plus 
Family, TI-86, and TI-
89

 Available only 
through Texas 
Instruments 7.76$            NO BID

GraphiTI Adhesive 
Overlays for cases

 Available only 
through Texas 
Instruments 5.05$            NO BID

Kickstand Slide Case 
for TI-84 Plus Family

 Available only 
through Texas 
Instruments 14.41$          5.50$               NO BID

Vernier EasyData 
App abd Easy Temp 
sensor

 Available through 
Vennier Software 45.10$          39.90$             NO BID

Biology with the TI-83 
Plus 18.45$                  20.20$          18.00$             NO BID

Periodic Table App

 Only Available 
only through 
Texas Instruments 10.10$          NO BID

Math and Science in 
Motion: Activities for 
Middle School 12.00$                  13.05$          15.00$             NO BID
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Activities for Middle 
Grades sciences with 
the CBL2 and the TI-
73 17.00$                  20.20$          18.00$             NO BID
Data Collection 
Activities for the 
Middle Grades with 
the TI-73, CBL and 
CBR 17.00$                  20.20$          18.00$             NO BID
TI Graphlink6 for Mac 
& PC 39.00$                  14.54$          NO BID
TIGLINKWINDOWS 
Windows User 13.00$                  14.54$          NO BID
TIGRAPHLINGUSB 13.00$                  14.54$          12.37$             NO BID
TI CBR Calculator 
Based Ranger 98.13$          NO BID

TI CBR2 New Motion 
Detector (has the 
mini USB connection 
to TI-84 Plus) 81.00$                  NO BID 86.60$             NO BID
TI 1098CS 
Classroom Set of 30 
TI108 111.20$                NO BID 38.00$             NO BID
TI15CS Classroom 
Set of 30 TI15 365.90$                143.99$        128.00$           NO BID
TI-10 9.25$                    14.50$          98.00$             NO BID
TI 203TK Overhead 
Calculator Model for 
TI108 28.40$                  45.45$          29.94$             NO BID
TI 204TK Overhead 
Calculator Model for 
TI12 52.50$                  NO BID 56.57$             NO BID
TI 251TK Overhead 
Calculator Model for 
TI15 55.50$                  71.99$          59.89$             NO BID
BWCALC Biology 
with Calculators 40.50$                  58.44$          NO BID
GPSBTA Gas 
Pressure Sensor 71.00$                  87.22$          78.00$             NO BID
TIVOYAGE 200 155.50$                195.66$        159.50$           NO BID
Stokes Teach Timer 
#SP-229 29.95$                  38.54$          35.00$             NO BID
BA II Plus 
Professional 
Financial Calculator 26.00$                  86.50$          42.98$             43.26$              
BA II Plus Financial 
Calculator 26.00$                  55.19$          25.26$             27.16$              
BA 20 Profit Manager 
Financial 19.50$                  36.06$          24.95$             20.49$              

Wireless Classroom 
Learning System 
(83+fam, 84+fam, 
73) TI Navigator 
Starter Kit wireless 
(16 seat) 2,100.00$             4,515.30$     2,169.00$        NO BID

Wireless Classroom 
Learning System 
(83+fam, 84+fam, 
73) TI Navigator 
Standard Kit wireless 
(32 seat) 3,475.00$             4,515.30$     3,559.00$        NO BID

TOTAL UNIT PRICE 10,489.73$           16,609.55$   9,836.25$        919.79$            
TOTAL TWO YEAR 
BID PRICE 490,921.50$         715,943.21$ 508,369.00$    199,967.55$     
Did not bid on all items. Awarded by lot.

These are the unit prices.

* =  TEACHERS PACK- LOTS OF 10 FOR EAI
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