Bid Tabulation

Buyer: Nancy Smith

06CM-71
Vacuums and Scrubbers
Name of Vendor: Wholesale Vacuum Porters Supply Co Good Way Technologies Superior Supply Holt
ITEM Description Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost | Total
NSS Model M-1
Item 1 Vacuum Cleaner NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Scrubber,
General KC-18
Item 2 w/pad driver NO BID NO BID $ 52695 $ 526950 $ 799.00 | $ 7,990.00 $ 495.00 | $ 4,950.00 $ 507.87 $ 5,078.70
Item 3 Carpet Extractor $ 1,032.00 $ 2,399.00 ' $ 23,990.00 $ 1,220.00 $ 12,200.00 $1,417.17 | $14,171.70
12" Upright
Item 4 Vacuum Cleaner| $ 170.00 | $ 1,700.00 NO BID NO BID $ 393.00 | $ 3,930.00 $ 25294 $ 2,529.40 $ 233.28 $ 2,332.80
Vacuum
Cleaner,
Advance 15"
Item 5 PowerOne $ 180.00 | $ 1,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 348.00 $ 3,480.00 $ 330.48 $ 3,304.80
Vacuum
Item 6 Wet/Dry $ 308.00 | $ 3,080.00 $ 38323 |$ 3,832.30 $ 428.00 | $ 4,280.00 $ 257.50 | $ 25,750.00 | $ 301.32 $ 3,013.20
Burnisher,
Whirlamatic
Item 7 20UHS #180700 | NO BID NO BID $ 74766 $ 7,476.60 $ 1,199.00 $ 11,990.00 $ 610.00 | $ 6,100.00 | $ 680.40 $ 6,804.00
Scrubber,
Automatic w/pad
holders & battery
Item 8 charger NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4,554.44 | $ 45544.40  $4,622.13 | $46,221.30
TOTAL PRICE $ 658.00 | $ 6,580.00 $ 2,689.84 | $ 26,898.40 $ 5,218.00 | $ 52,180.00 $ 7,737.88 $ 77,441.80  $8,092.65 | $80,926.50
*ITEM 1- GLOBAL INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT- REJECTED
*ITEM 3- PORTERS SUPPLY- REJECTED |




Bid Tabulation
06CM-71
Vacuums and Scrubbers

Buyer: Nancy Smith

W. Wederrecht Marketing Leonard Paper Co Fitch Co Acme Paper & Supply Daycon Products Global Industrial Equipment
Unit Cost Total Unit Cost | Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost | Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,008.00 $ 20,160.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 27361 $ 5,472.20
$ 680.00 $ 6,800.00 $ 590.00 $ 5,900.00 $ 724.00 $ 7,240.00 $ 489.00 | $ 4,890.00 NO BID NO BID $ 64745 % 6,474.50
NO BID $1,448.00  $14,480.00 ' $ 1,611.00 $ 16,110.00 $1,098.00 $19,980.00 $ 1,523.68 $ 15,236.80 $ 1,878.25 $ 18,782.50
NO BID NO BID $ 280.00 $ 2,800.00 $ 396.00 $ 3,960.00 $ 370.00 $ 3,700.00 $ 241.10 $ 2,411.00 $ 27761 $ 2,776.10
NO BID NO BID $ 384.00 $ 3,840.00 $ 412.00 $ 4,120.00 $ 388.00 $ 3,880.00 $ 29950 $ 2,995.00 $ 376.70  $ 3,767.00
$ 472.00 $ 4,720.00 $ 315.00 $ 3,150.00 NO BID NO BID $ 275.00 $ 2,750.00 ' $ 45223 $ 4,522.30 $ 34870 $ 3,487.00
$ 999.00 $ 9,990.00 $ 775.00 $ 7,750.00 $ 1,562.00 $ 15,620.00 $ 609.00 | $ 6,090.00 $ 1,076.69 $ 10,766.90 $ 1,207.90 | $ 12,079.00
NO BID NO BID $5,880.00  $58,800.00 ' $ 6,577.00 $ 65,770.00 $5,490.00 $54,900.00 $ 6,432.52 $ 64,325.20 $ 5,120.60 |$ 51,206.00
$ 2,151.00  $21,519.00 $9,672.00 $96,720.00 $12,290.00 $132,980.00 | $8,719.00 $96,190.00 $10,025.72 | $100,257.20 $10,130.82 | $  104,044.30
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